et & @ Tr-—(TH)04/0007/2003—07 ~ REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—07

@he Gaﬁette of 3mlia

- yifier @ yeifire
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

o §6] % feeeht, qrwfoan, Rewax 13, 2007 / srrwrw 22, 1929 (
No. 56 NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, DECEMBER 13, 2007 /AGRAHAYANA 22, 1929

Wmﬁﬁawmifﬂ%ﬁqﬁﬁnamm%wﬁmmﬁn

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as o separate complhtmn

MINISTRY OF LAWAND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

» New Delhi, the i3th D,ec'émbe:; 2007/Agrahayana 22,1929 (Sa/ca)

The following Act of Parlianent received the assent of the President on the
- 12th Deccmbei’, 2007,and is hc;eby_ published for general ;nformati'on:»-u—

THE INDIAN BOILERS (AMLNDMENT) ACT, 2007
No. 49 oF 2007
{124 December, 2007 ]

AnAct further to amend the Indian Boilers Act, 1923.
Be it enacted by Farhament in the Fifly-eighth Year of the Republic of India as

follows:——
1. (1) This Act may be called the Indian Boilers (Amendment) Act, 2f}07 . Short title and
. . B conunencement.
» (2) li shall come into force on such date as the Central Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, appoint; and different dates may be appomte-d for. dlﬁerem provns'ons
of this Act.
5 of 1923 - 2. In section | of the Indian Boilers Act, 1923 (hé'réinaﬂer referced to as the principal  Amendment
Act), in sub-section (/), the word "Indian" shail be omitted. of section 1.
3. In section 2 of the p;ji‘n_'c“ipa‘!_Act,—--j ' ' ' Amendment
L ’ ) ‘ of secuon 2.

(1) for clause (a), the following clause shall he substituted, namely.— -

iy



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [PaRT 11—

(a) "accndcnt" megms an explosnon of bmler or boiler comp.ment, which is
calculated to weaken the strength or an uncon(rolled release of water-or steam

therefrom Ilable to cause dealh or mJury to any person or damage to any property, ;

i (2 for Clause (b), the followmg clauses shall be substltuted namely

‘(b) "boiler" means a pressure vessel in which steam is generatgd for use
external to itself by application of heat which is wholly or partly under pressure
when steam is shut off but does not include a pressure vessel,—

(f) with capacity less than 25 litres (such capacity being measured
from the feed check valve to the main steam stop valve);

(i) with less than one k||0gram per centimetre square design gauge
pressure and working gauge pressure; dr

(iéif) in Wthh water is heated below one hundred degrces centl-
grade; . ,

(ba) "boiler c"ompon'er'l’t'."fnéans'steam piping, feed piping, economiser,
superheater, any mounting or other fitting and any other external or internal part

of a boiler which is subject to pressure exceedmg one kllogram per centimetre
square gauge;’ :

(3) after clause (c), the following clauses shall be inserted, némely:—

'(ca) "Competent Authority” means an institution recognised in such man-
ner as may be prescribed by regulations for issue of certificate to the welders for
welding of boiler and boiler components;

" (ch) "Competent Person” means a person recognised in such manner as
may be prescribed by regulations for inspection and certification of boilers and
boiler components during, manufacture, crection and use. All Inspectors shall be

- ipso fucto competent persons, i

(4) after clause (ccc), the following clauses shall be mserted ‘namely:—

(ced) "lnspecting Authority” means an institution recognised in such
manner as may be prescribed by regulations for the inspection and oemhcatlon
of boilers and boiler components during manufacture. All Chief Inspectors of
Boilers shall be ipso facto lnspecting Authorities;

(cce) "manufacture” means manufacture, construction and fabrication of
boiler or boiler component, or both; :

(ccf) "manufacturer” means a person engaged in the manufacture;',

() inclause (d), for the wo«ds "includes any person" the. words "includes any
person possessing or” shall be substituted; :

. (6) for clause (), the following clause'shall be substituted, namely:—
'(f) "steam .;Sipe",means any pipe ﬁhrouigh which steam passes if—

(i) the pressure at which steam passés through such pipe exceeds
3.5 kilegram per square centimetres above atmospheric pressure, or

(if) such pipe exceeds 254 mnlllmetres in internal diameter and the
pressure of, steam exceeds 1 kilogram per square céntimetres above the
atmospherie’ pressure,

and includes in either case any connected fitting of a steam-pipe;";
(7) for clause (g), the following clauses shall be substituted, namely:—

'(g) "structural alteration, addition or renewal” means,—



Sec.1]  THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

(4) any change in the design of a boiler or b’ofler cmnponem'

(ii) replacement of any part of boiler or boilcr component by a part

. which does not conform to, the same spv..cnﬁc.atuon or -
(iii) any addition to any part of a boiler or boiler component;

(h) "superheater” méans any equipment which'is partly or wholly exposed
to flue gases for the purpose of raising the temperature of steam beyond the
" saturation temperature at that pressure and includes a re-heater;

(;) "Technical Advtser" means the chhmcal Adviser appmnted under
~ sub-section (/) of section 4A.".

4. For section 3 of the principal Act, the following scction shall l?_e'substitﬁted_, namely —

"3. Nothing in this Act shall apply to— )
| (a) locomotive boilers belonging to or under the control of the railways;
(b) any boiler or boiler component,— « |
(i) in any vessel‘prop’éllcd whol|y or in pan by the agency of steam;

(i) belonging to, or under the com'nl of, me Army, Navy or Air
Force; or

* (#fi) appertaining to a steriliver disinfuctor used in hospitals or nursing
homes, if the boiler does not exceed one hundred litres in capacity.”.

s, After section 4 of the principal Act, the following sections shall bé inserted, namely:--

"4A. (1) The Central Government shall appointa 1 echmcal Adviser from dmongst
the persons having such qualifications and experience as may be prescn’oed by rules.

(2) The terms and conditions of service of the Technicad Adviser shall be such as
.may be prescribed by the Central Government..

(3) The Tcchnical Adviser shall, in addition to exercising the powers and
d\schargmg the functions assigned to him under this Act or rules or regulations made
thereunder, exercise such other powers and discharge such functions as the Central
Government and the Board may delegate to him. '

4B. (1) Any person who proposes to undertake any welding work connected
with or related to a boiler, or a boiler component or both shall apply to a Competent
- Authority for issue of a Welders certificate:.

(2) On receipt of anr applicationunder sub-section (/). the (,on.petent Authonty
shall follew such procedure for examiunation and-grant of Welders certificate as may be
prescribed by regulations. -

{3) The Competent Authority may, |f satisfied that the persen applying for Welders
certificate under sub-section (2) has complied with the conditions precedent for issue
of the Welders certificate, issuc such cétificate, to such person subject to the payment
of such fee and such other conditions as may be prescribed by regulations:

Provided that the Competent Authotity shall not refuse Weldais certificate to
any person unless such person is given an opportunity of heing heard.

‘ 4C. (1) No person shall manufacture or r cause to be nwuufaumred any boiler or
bonler component, or both' unlcss-— o

(a) he has pmwded in the prcnmes or prec:m.ts wherein such boiler or

boiler component, or both are manufactured,; such facilities for design and
construction as may be prescribed by regulations;

S

Substitution of
new section
for section 3

Limitation of
application.

tnsertion of
uew sections
4A to 4F.
Techunical
Adviser.

Welders
certificate.

“onditions
precedent for
manufacture
of boifey and
boiler
compenent,



Inspection
during
manufacture

Inspection
dunng
cruction

Condittons
precedent for
repainng
boiler and
boiler”
wmpmcmf

4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [ParY I1—

(b) the dcs:gn and drawmgs of the boller and bailer comp()nent have been
-approved by the lnspectlng Authonty under clausc (a) of sub-section (2) of
section 4D; -

(¢) the méterials;’mounting ‘-and‘»'ﬁttifigs used in the construction of such
boiler or boiler componént; or both conformi to the specifications prescribed by
regulations;- and

~ (d) the persons’ engaged for wcldmg bonler or boiler componem hold
. Weliders certificate issued by a C o?hpetent Authonly

4D. (/) Every manufacturer, before commencing manufacture of a bonler or boiler
component, shall engage an Inspecting Authority for carrying out inspection at such
stages of manufacture as may be prescribed by rcgulatnons

(2) The Inspecting Authority engaged under sub-section .(I) shali follow such
procedure for inspection and certificaticn of boiler orboiler component as may be
prescribed by regulations and after inspection, if it is—

{a) satisfied that the boiler or the boiler component conforms to the stand-
ards prescribed by regulations, it shail issue a certificate of inspection and
stamp the boiler, or boiler componént, or both; or -+ -

(b) of the cpinion that the boiler, or boiler component, or both does not
conform to the standards prescribed by regulations, it may for reasons to be
recorded in writing refuse to issue such certificate: - '

Provided that no certificate shail be refused unless the Inspecting Authority
had directed the manufacturer of the boiler or boiler componient, or both in writing
ta carry. out such modifications or rectifications as it deems necessary and the
Inspecting Authority is.of the opinion that inspite of such direction the manufac-
turer of the boiler or boiler component, or both did not carry out the direction.

(?) The Inspecting Authomy may, for the purposes of inspection under this section,
charge such fee as may be prescribed by regulations.

4E.(/) The oWri'er who proposes to register a boiler under section 7, shall engage
on Inspecting Authority for carrying out inspection at. the stage: of erection of the
boiler. , ' : o _

(2) The Inspecting Authority shall follow such procedure for inspection and
certification of a boiler-or boiler component, or both as may be prescribed by regula-
tions and after inspection if it is— :

(a) satisfied that the erection of the boiler is.in accordance wuh the regu-
lations, it shall issue a certificate of inspection in such form as may be prescrlbed
by.regulations;-or .. ..

(b) of the opinion that the: boxlcr has. not been erected in accordance with
the regulations, it may for reasons:to be recorded in writing, refuse to grant the
certificate and shall communicate such refusal to the manufacturer of the boiler

~or boiler component forthwith:

Provided that no such certificate shall be refuscd unless the Inspecting
‘Authority had directed the owner in writing to carry out such modifications or
rectifications as it deems necessary and the Inspecting Authority is of the opin-
ion that in spite of such direction the owner did not carry out the direction.

(3) The Inspecting Authority may, for the purposes of mspectmn under this
section, charge such fee as may be prescribed by rcgulanons

4F. No person shall repair or cause to be repaired any boiler or bonler component
or both, unless—

(a) he has provnded in the premnes or precmcts where in such boiler or
boiler component or both are being used, such facnhues for repairs as may be
prescribed by regulatlons



Sec.1] "7 THE GAZETTE OF, INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 5

~ (BYthe designand drawmg,s ot the boiler or boxier comporient, as the case . -
“"may be, and the materials, mountuu.s and fittings used in the rcpau of such
boiler or boiler compouent conform to the regulatlona,

, (c) persons engaged in welding, holds & Welders certificate issued by a
Competent Authority; :

' {d) every user who does not have the in-house facil_itieé for repair of boiler
or boiler component shall engage a Boiler Repairer possessing a Boiler Repairer
certificate for repair of a boiles or boiler component or both, as the casc may be:

- (e) every user shall engage a (‘ompctem Person tor approval of repairs to
be camed out in-house or by the repairers.”.

6. In section 5 of the pnncxpal Act, after sub-section (4), the following sub-section  Amendment
shall be inserted, namely:-- ' . : of scction 5.

"(4A) No person shatl be sppointed as the Chief Inspector, Deputy Chief Inspector
or Inspector uniess he possesses such quahﬁcatnons and experience as may be
prescribed by the Central Govcmmcm B

r

7. In section 6 of the principal Act, in clause («), for the words "State Government" the Amendment
words "Central Government" shall be substituted. ' » of section 6.

8. In section 7 of the principai Act,-— ' . . Amendment

) . . . of scetion 7.
{(a) in sub-secticn (/), for the words "may apply to the Inspector to have the :

boiler registered”, the words "may apply to the Inspector along with such other
documents as may be prescribed by reguuatmns to have the boiler registered” shall be
substituted;

(b) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

"(3) On the said date the Inspector shall ihspec-t the boiler with a view to
satisfying himsclt that the boiler has not suffered any damage during its transit
from the place or manufacture to the site of erection and forwdrd a report of the
inspection alongwith the documents to the Chief Inspector within seven days.".

9. In section 8 of the principal Act,— , Amendment
C. ‘ of scction §.
(a) in sub-section (1),—-
(#) in clause (), for the figures "18.58", the figurcs "20™ shall be substituted;
{ii) for clause (o), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

"(d) save as provided in section 12, when any structural alteration,
addition or renewal is made in or to the boiler;";

. (iii) in clause (f}, for the words "it or any steam pipe", the words "“it or any
boiler component"” shall be substituted;

(b) for sub-section (3); the followirig sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

"(3) When a certificate ceases to be in,fbr,ce, the owner of the boiler may
apply to the Competent Person for renewal thereof for such period as may be
_prescribed by regulations.”;

(¢) for sub-sections (4) and (5) the followmg sub-sectwns shall be substituted,
namcly e

"(4) On receipt of an application under sub-section (3), the Competent
Person shall, within fifleén days from the date of such receipt, inspect the bonler
in such manner as may be prescribed by regulations.

(5) Iif'the Compe;ent Person is—



Amendment
of sectinn 9.

Amendment

of sechon 1

Anmendment
ol sectop 12

S

Subsittetum of

new section
for section 13
Alteration cr
renewas! of
bouler
comiponent

Amendcent
of secticn 14,

6 ~ _THE GAZ.ETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [ParT I1—

) (a) satis hcd that the bo:ler and the bonlcr components attached
"~ thereto are in good condition he shall issuc a certificate for such period as
-may‘be prescribed by regulations.

() of the opinion that the boiler or boiler component, or both does
not conform to the standards prescribed by regulations, it may, for reasons
- to be recorded in writing, refuse to-issue such certificate:

Provided that no cerificate shall be refused unless the Inspecting
Autherity had directed the owner of the boiler or the boiler component, or
both in writing to cany"i‘.iﬁi such modifications or rectifications as it deems

. necessary and the Competent Person is of the opinion that inspite of such
direction the owner of the boiler or boiler companent, or both did not carry
out the dire.tion: ' ‘

Piovided further that the Competent Person shall, within forty-eight
" howrs of making the examinagion, inform the owner of the boiler or boiler
component any defect in his opinion and the reasons therefor and shall

. forthwuh repoit the case to the Chief Inspet tor.

{/) The Lcmpq ‘1t Person may for the purpose of mspectmn under this -
section charge such fee as may be prescribed by regulations.”.
10, section 9 of the principal Act, the words, brackets and figures “or sub-section
{J) of section 8™ shaif be omited. ‘
11. insection 11 of the principai Act, —
A

(@) inchause {0), forthe words, "State Government”, . thewords "Central Govern-
ment” shall be substituted; '

(fv) leUﬁC (c!) aud Nu pro nsn shall bc omx'tw

12. ln section 12 ofthe principal Act. the follow ing proviso shall be inserted at the end,
hamely:— : :

“Pravided that no such sanciion is required where the structural alteration,
addition or renewa’ is made under ihe supervision of a Competent Person.™.

13, For section 13 of the. principai Act, the following se(.!mn shall be substituted,

RIEN) Before tie owner of any boiler registered under this Act makes any
structural alteration, addition or renewal in or t: any boiler component attached to the
boier, e shall transevit to the Chief Inspectos a report in wnting of his intention and
send therewith such particulars of proposed alteration, addition or renewal as may be
prescribed lw reguldtlon

{2) Any structural ahea ation, addition or renewal ieterred to in sub-section (1)
shali be made by a person po: m.sma a Boiler Repairer certificate under the supervnsmn
of the ("ﬂmpetcm Perwn

14. In section 14 ut du, prmupal Act,—-
{a) in sub-section (1),

(i) in clawse (). {or the word ‘Imputor" the woids."Competent Person"
shail be-substityted;

()i in clause (b), for the wurds‘ pﬂ.‘SCNde manner”, the words "manner
prwbrmcd by regulations” shall be s,ubsmutcd

(mr_) in clause (¢}, for the words "be prescribed”, the words "be prescribed
by repulations” shall be substituted,

g,



Skc. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

. (b)Y in sub-sectiori (2), for the word “Inspector”; the words "Competent
Person” shall be substituted. =

15, In section 15 of the principal Act, for the words and figures “the-Indian Factories
Act, 1911", the words and figures "the Factories Act, 1948" shall be substituted..

" 16..In section 18 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (7}, for the word "n.team-pnpe a( both the places where it
- occurs, the words "boiler compomm" shall be subsmuted

{(b) after sub-section (2), the followmg sub-section shal] be inserted, namely:—

“(3) Withowt prejudice to the provisions of sub-section (/), where any
death has resulted due to any accident, an inquiry may be conducted by such
'person and in such manner as may be prescribed by the Central Government.".

17. Section 19 of the pn’nCipa! Act shall be renumbered as sub-section (/ ) thereaf and
after sub-section (/) as so renumbered, the following sub-section shall be mserted ‘namely:—

"(2) Every appeal under sub—secnon (I} shallbe made insuch mdnner as may be
prescnbed by the State Government.

(3) The procedure for disposing of an appeal shall be such as may be prescribed
by the State Government.”

18. Section 20 of the 'principal Act shall be renumbered as sub-section (/) and—

(@) in sub-section () as so renumbered, for the words "lodge with the Chief
Inspector an appeal to an Appellate Authority to be constituted by the State Govern-
ment under this Act”, the words “prefer an appeal to the Central Government” shall be
substituted; '

(b) after sub-secticn (/) as so renumbered, the following sub-sections shall be
inserted, namely:-—

"(2) Any person considering himself aggrieved by the refusal of an In-
specting Authority to grant a certificate of inspection of manufacture or erec-
tion, as the case may be, may, within thirty days from the date of communication
of such refusal, prefer an appeat to the Central Government.

{(3) Every appeal under sub-section () shall be made in such manner as
may be prescribed by the Central Government.

(4) The procedure for disposing of an appedl shall be such as may be
prescribed by the Central Government.”.

19. Insection 21 ofthe principal Act, for the words, figures and letters "An order of the
Central Government under section 20A and save as otherwise provided in sections 19, 20
and 20A, an order of an appetlate authority", the words, figures and letter "An order of the
Central Governmeut under sections 20 and 20A," shali be substituted.

20. In section 22 of the principal Act, for the words "one hundred rupees"”, the' words
- "five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

21. In section 23 of the principal Act,— ‘

(a) for the words "five hundred rupees", the words "one lakh rupees” shall be
substituted; ‘

(b) for the words "one hundred -rupees”, the words one thousand rupees" shall
be substituted.

22. In section 24 of the principal A‘ct,A for the words "punishable with fine which may
extend to five hundred rupees”, the words "punishable with imprisonment which may extend

Amcandment
of suction 5.

Amendment

- of section 18, -

Amendment
of section 19.

Amendment ?
of scction 20,

Amendment
of section 21,

Amendment
of section 22.

Amendment
of section 23.

Amendment
of scction 24



‘8 - THE (1AZEN OF INDIA LXTRAO:{DlNARY ‘ © o [ParTTl—

1o two years or with fine wh)ch may cxtcnd to one Takh rupec.s ot W|th both" ;shall be
substituted. ’ «

Amendment 23, i section 25 of thc'principai'Act,'—--
of section 25, . . . B A

~ {a) in sub:sectioni (1), for the words five hundred rupees”, the words "one lak|n ‘
rupees” shall be substituted;

{b) in sub-section (2), for the words "fi ine, or with both" the words "fine which
may extend to one lakh rupees gr with both” shall be substitated.
Awendment " 24, In section 27A of the principal Act, for sub-sccuons (2) and (3), the fol|0\mnz>
‘:f, i"““"“ sub-see tnons shall be substituted, namuty:—- :
"(2) The Board shall consist of the iollowmg membe:s namely —

(a) the Secretary to the Government of India incharge ofthe Department of
the Central Government baving administrative control of the Board who shall be
the Chairperson ex officio;

{b) a senior technical officer conversant with the inspection and examina-
tion of boilers, to be nominated by the Govemmem of each State (other than a
Union territory);

{¢) equal number of other persons as in sub-section (b) above to
represent-- - : :

{i) Central (Jovcmmem
" (if) the Bureau of lnduan f:tandards
(i) boiler and botler component manutacturers,
‘ (iv) National laboratories,
{v) enginwring consultancy agencies,
(w) users ot boilers, and

- (vid) such olher interests which in the opinion of the Central
. , (mvemment uug,h o be rcpr»semed on the Board,

to be nominated Ly f,hc ,Len,:ral Covernment,
- {d) Technial Adlvise‘r, ,Mcmbgrv—S’ecreiary ex-gjfficio.
'(3) The terin of office of the membérs notminated under clauses (b) and (¢) of
, sub-section (2) shall be such as may be pr\r'«c‘ribed by the Central Government.™.
Amendment . | 25, In secuon 28 of the principal Act, in sub- section { 1)y

of section 28
(:) far clause (a), the foli sowmh clause sh'\ll be «--bstmn,d mmely -

(). for iaying down the sumdard conditions in respect of material.
design, construction, crection, hpcration and maintenance which shall be.
required for the purposes of euabling the registration aud certification of boilers,
boiler compenen?y, boiler mountings and fuings under thne Act;™;

(u) in clause (), for'the word “steam-pipes”, the words "lvnler components,
beiler mountings and fittings" shall be substituted,
(iii) after clause (¢); the following clauses shall be inserted, namely.—

, “(ea) for prescribing the qualifications and experiencs subject to which
the lnspectmg, s Authoritizs, Competent Aulaorities and Competent Pursons shall
be recogniséd under ihis Act;

{eb)y the conditions subject 1o which and ihe manner in which
minufacturer of bosler components or matesial may be vecognised;



Sec. 1] . THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAGRDINARY . . o 9

~'(ec) facilities for design and construction which are required to be
- provided. in the premises in which the manufacturing-of any boiler or boiler
" component is carried cut; AT

(ed) fee for the purposes of inspection: oft prant of recognition or any
certificate under this Act;

(ef) procedure for examination and grant of Welders certificate;
" (eg) powers and functions which the Roard way delegate to the Technical

. Adviser

(eh) docuinents 0 be enclosed along with the a{_ phcatlon for registration
of boilers or renewal of a certificate authorising the use of boilers;

(ef) the manner of inspection of boilers;
.. f{e)) the petind for whlch a Lemﬁcate duthormng lhe use of a boiler mdy be
renewed; :
., (ek) the conditions subject 1o which and the form in whuh Competent
Person shall renew a certificaté’ authorising the nse of boilers;

(el) the manner cmd the iorm in which a Repai rers certificate shall be
issued; :

(em) the manner in which the boiler shal! be preprared for éxamination;

{en) drawings, specnﬁranon documcnts and mher partlculars whxch owner. "
ofa bonler is rf.quned to make avallable to the Competent Person; )

“ai (ew) the manner in whxch a pe'son may be duthoru.ed to conduct energy
audn and the manner in whxch such audit shall be conducted;

y (ep) the manner in which disputes between the States with respect to
registration of boilers shall be resotved.": ~ :

~ 26. In section 28 A of the principal Act, for sub«-sectionv(.!), the following sub-section Amendment of
shall be substituted, namely:— scclion 28A.

"(7) The Central Government may, by notitication ini the Official Gazette, makc
rules to carry out the provisions of this Act.

(A In parﬁcular, and without prejudice to the generality of the foregoing power,
such rules may provide for all or any of the following matters, namely:—

{a) the procedure to be followed in imaking applications under section 20A
and the fees payable in respect of such application;

(b) the qualifications and experiencé of persons to be appointed as Chief
Inspectors, Deputy Chief Inspectors and Inspectors;

(¢) the manner in which appeals may be preferred to the Board, the fees
payable in respect of appeals and the procedure to be followed of disposing
such appeals;

'

() the term of office of the members and the manner in which they shall be ‘
nominated under clauses (b) and (¢) of sub-section (2) of section 27A;

(e) the quallfmanons and expenen% of the. Technical Adviser;

{/) for requiring boi le.rs tobe under the charge of persons holding certificate
of proficiency or competency and for prescribing the condmons on whlch such
certificate may be granted;

(g) the manner in whxch and the person who shall conduct inquiry into the
accident.” o



Amcodaient

v section 29

Avrsengyiieng

o setion S

St adovaal

ai jection 37

A ndans

- N
eV Rechon W

10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY " [ParT1}=Sec. 1]

27. In section 29 of the principal Act, in sub-section (£},
(¢) tor ciause (@), the foliowing clause shall be subsmuted namely -

"(a) the powers and daties of the Chiet Inspector, Deputy Chief Inspectors
and {nspectors,”™;

{1} clause {¢) s'm-.ll'be_ -,’ff-]ill(:d!;

(i) tor ;iau;e (N, the following gla{:sc shail be substituted, namely:-—
"{f) fee payable for y'egistratfon of boilers:";

(sv) for clanse (A3, the followiny clause shall be substituted, namely:-—-

"{ k) the manner in which appcals shall be prefesred to the Chief Inspector
and the procedure w be fullowed for hearing such appeals;”;
(v) clause (5) shall be omitted. ;

28. In section 39 of the prncipal Act,~ -

(a) for the words "one hundred rupees”, the words, "one thousand rupees” shall
he substituted;

() for the words "one ihousand rupecs”, the words "one lakh rupees” shall be
substituted; \

24, I section 33 of the principal Act, for the word "s'eam-pipes”, the words "boiler
componenis” shall be substituted. '

3G, in section 34 of the rrmcnpai Acl for s secnon 131 the following sub-secuon
shiall be substituted. namely:- '

(3 1t the State Governioent is satisfied that having regard to the material,
design or construction of boilers and to the need for the rapid industrialisation of the
couatry, it is necessary so fo de, it may. by notification in the Official Gazette and
subject to such conditions as may be prescribed by regulations, exempt any boiler or
hoiler components in the whole or any part ofthe State from the operation of ali or any
of the provisions of this Act.”.

K N.CHATURVED,
Secy. to the Govt. of India.

PRINTED BY‘I HE MANAGER, GOV OF INDLA PRESS. \iIN’I O ROAL, NEW DEI i
AND “Vrﬂl.lSHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBNICATIONE, DELHI, 2567,

MGIPMRND —-5355G1{S-5)—14.12.2007.

Cy



