
PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ.(EXTRA), AUGUST 29, 2025

(BHDR 7, 1947 SAKA)

EXTRAORDINARY
Published by Authority

        CHANDIGARH, FRIDAY, AUGUST 29, 2025

(BHADRA 7, 1947 SAKA)

LEGISLATIVE  SUPPLEMENT

Contents Pages

Part - I Acts

The Punjab Shops and Commercial
Establishments (Amendment) Act, 2025.

(Punjab Act No.12 of 2025)

Part - II Ordinances

Nil

Part - III Delegated Legislation

Notification No. S.O. 282/C.A.1/1894/S.48/
C.A.30/ 2013/Ss.93 and 114/C.A.10/1897/
S.6/2025 dated 28.08.2025 withdrawing
from the acquisition proceedings in respect
of the land described in the Schedule.

Part - IV Correction  Slips,  Republications and
Replacements

Nil
______

( cxxxviii )

... 441-445

... 1191-1192



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ.(EXTRA), AUGUST 29, 2025

(BHDR 7, 1947 SAKA)

PART 1

GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB

DEPARTMENT OF LEGAL AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS, PUNJAB

NOTIFICATION

The 28th August, 2025

No. 13-Leg./2025.- The following Act of the Legislature of the State of

Punjab received the assent of the Governor of Punjab on the 06th day of

August, 2025, is hereby published for general information :-

THE PUNJAB SHOPS AND COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS

(AMENDMENT) ACT, 2025

(Punjab Act No. 12 of 2025)

AN

ACT

further to amend the Punjab Shops and Commercial Establishments

Act, 1958.

BE it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Punjab in the

Seventy-sixth Year of the Republic of India, as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Punjab Shops and Commercial

Establishments (Amendment) Act, 2025.

(2) It shall come into force on and with effect from the date of its

publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Punjab Shops and Commercial Establishments Act, 1958

(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 1, for sub-section (4),

the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

"(4) The provisions of this Act shall apply to the shops and establishments

employing twenty or more workers, whereas to shops and establishments

employing less than twenty workers only section 13-A shall be applicable:

Provided that whenever number of workers in any shop or

establishment, with less than twenty workers, becomes twenty or more,

the provisions of this Act shall become applicable."

441

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment in
section 1 of
Punjab Act 15
of 1958.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ.(EXTRA), AUGUST 29, 2025

(BHDR 7, 1947 SAKA)

3.  In the principal Act, in section 6, for sub-section (4), the following sub-

section shall be substituted, namely:-

"(4) In the case of any contravention of, or failure to comply with,

the provisions of this section, the employer shall be liable, on conviction,

to pay fine, to be imposed by the competent authority as notified by the

State Government, which shall not be less than one thousand rupees and

not more than twenty-five thousand rupees for the first offence and not

less than five thousand rupees and not more than fifty thousand rupees

for the second offence and may impose fine at the rate of rupees one

thousand for each day if any subsequent offence continues.

Explanation.- Second and subsequent offence means the offence committed

after a period of three months from the date on which a similar offence

was committed earlier and an offence committed after a duration of more

than one year of the earlier offence shall be considered as first offence."

4. In the principal Act, in section 7,-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "nine hours", the words "ten hours"

shall be substituted; and

(ii) in sub-section (2), in the proviso, in clause (a), for the word  "fifty",

the words "one hundred forty-four" shall be substituted.

5. In the principal Act, in section 8, in sub-section (2), for the words "ten

hours", the words "twelve hours" shall be substituted.

6. In the principal Act, for section 13, the following section shall be substituted,

namely:-

"13.(1) On and with effect from the date of commencement of the

Punjab Shops and Commercial Establishments

(Amendment) Act, 2025, the employer of every establishment

employing twenty or more   workers  shall,  within  a  period  of  six

months from the date of  commencement  of  his  business,  apply  for

registration and obtain registration certificate.

(2) Every application for registration under sub-section (1) shall be

made in such form and in such manner together with such fee, as may be

prescribed.

Amendment in
section 6 of
Punjab Act 15
of 1958.

Amendment in
section 7 of
Punjab Act 15
of 1958.

Amendment in
section 8 of
Punjab Act 15
of 1958.

Substitution of
section 13 of
Punjab Act 15
of 1958.

Registration of
establishments.

442



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ.(EXTRA), AUGUST 29, 2025

(BHDR 7, 1947 SAKA)

(3) The Inspector shall, on receipt of an application under sub-

section (2), register the establishment and issue a registration certificate

to the employer, for a duration as prescribed, within twenty-four hours in

such form, as may be prescribed. If the registration certificate is not

issued by the Inspector within a period of twenty-four hours from the

date of receipt of application, the registration certificate shall be deemed

to have been granted under this Act.

(4) The Inspector shall maintain a register of establishments, in

such form, as may be prescribed.

(5) The registration certificate shall be prominently displayed in the

establishment by the employer.

(6) The employer shall give intimation to the Inspector, of any change

in any of the particulars furnished in the application form submitted under

sub-section (2) together with such fee as may be prescribed, within a

period of thirty days of such change. The Inspector shall, on receipt of

such intimation, amend the registration certificate or issue a fresh

registration certificate.

(7) The employer shall, within a period of thirty days of the closure

of the establishment, give intimation of such closure to the Inspector

and on receipt of such intimation, the Inspector shall cancel the registration

certificate."

7. In the principal Act, after section 13, the following section shall be inserted,

namely:-

"13-A. Employer  of  every establishment  employing  less than twenty

workers shall, within a period of six months from the

date of  commencement of  the Punjab  Shops and

Commercial Establishments (Amendment) Act, 2025, or  within a period

six months from the date of commencement of his business, give intimation

of his business to the Inspector in such form, as may be prescribed. The

Inspector shall record the particulars furnished by the employer in such

register, as may be prescribed:

Provided that if at any point of time, the number of workers engaged

in the establishment become twenty or more, then all the provisions of

Insertion of
section 13-A in
Punjab Act 15
of 1958.

Intimation of
Business.

443



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ.(EXTRA), AUGUST 29, 2025

(BHDR 7, 1947 SAKA)

this Act shall apply to such establishment and the employer of such

establishment shall apply for registration and obtain a registration certificate

as per the provisions of section 13."

8. In the principal Act, in section 21, for sub-section (2), the following sub-

section shall be substituted, namely:-

"(2) Whoever contravenes the provisions of sub-section (1) or

willfully obstructs the inspecting authority in the exercise of the powers

under this Act or conceals or prevents any employee in an establishment

from appearing before or being examined by the authority, shall be liable,

on conviction, to pay fine which shall not be less than one thousand rupees

and not more than ten thousand rupees for the first offence and not less

than three thousand rupees and not more than fifty thousand rupees for

the second offence. The competent authority as notified by the State

Government may impose fine at the rate of five hundred rupees for each

day if any subsequentoffence continues.

Explanation.- Second and subsequent offence means the offence

committed after a period of three months from the date on which a similar

offence was committed earlier and an offence committed after a duration

of more than one year of the earlier offence shall be considered as first

offence."

9. In the principal Act, for section 26, the following section shall be substituted,

namely:-

"26. Subject to the other provisions of this Act, whoever contravenes

any  of  the  provisions  of   this  Act  or  the rules made

thereunder   and  no   penalty  has   been    provided   for

such  contravention   in   this   Act,  shall  be  liable, on conviction, to   pay

fine   which   not  be  less  than five  hundred  rupees and not more than

two thousand rupees  for  the  first  offence  and not less than three

thousand rupees  and  not  more   than  thirty  thousand rupees for   any

subsequent offence. Competent   authority   may  impose  fine at the rate

of five hundred rupees for each day if subsequent offence continues.

Explanation.- Second and subsequent offence means the offence

committed after a period of three months from the date on  which a

similar offence was committed  earlier  and  an offence  committed

Amendment in
section 21 of
Punjab Act 15
of 1958.

Substitution of
section 26 of
Punjab Act 15
of 1958.

Penalties.

444



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ.(EXTRA), AUGUST 29, 2025

(BHDR 7, 1947 SAKA)

after a duration of more than one year of the earlier offence shall be

considered as first offence."

10. In the principal Act, after section 26, the following section shall be inserted,

namely:-

"26-A.(1)  The State Government shall, by notification in the Official

Gazette,  appoint any person as competent authority

to compound the offences under this Act for such

amount and in such manner, as may be prescribed:

Provided that the competent authority may, after giving the person

a reasonable opportunity of being heard in the matter, and if, on such

inquiry, is satisfied that the person concerned has contravened or has not

complied with any of the provisions of sections 6, 20, 21 and 26, or the

rules made thereunder or order issued thereunder, impose such

composition fee which shall not exceed maximum fine specified under

these sections.

(2) Where an offence has been compounded under sub-section (1),

no further proceedings shall be taken against the offender in respect of

such offence."

11. In the principal Act, the Schedule appended thereto shall be omitted.

Sd/-

DEVINDER KUMAR GUPTA,

Legal Remembrancer,

Department of Legal and Legislative Affairs.

3489/8-2025/Pb. Govt. Press, S.A.S. Nagar.

Insertion of
section 26-A in
Punjab Act 15
of 1958.

Omission of
Schedule.

Compounding
of offence.

445



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ.(EXTRA), AUGUST 29, 2025

(BHDR 7, 1947 SAKA)

1191

PART III

GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB

DEPARTMENT OF LOCAL GOVERNMENT

(LOCAL GOVERNMENT-1 BRANCH)

NOTIFICATION

The 28thAugust, 2025

No. S.O. 282/C.A.1/1894/S.48/C.A.30/2013/Ss.93 and 114/C.A.10/1897/s.6/

2025.-Whereas The Government of Punjab, Department of Local Government vide

Notification No.14/153/11-4LG1/5780, dated  the31st October, 2011, initiated the process of

acquiring land measuring 8.15 acres under section 4 of the Land Acquisition Act, 1894

(Central Act No.1 of 1894) at Village Basti Peerdad, Tehsil and District Jalandhar-1, for the

purpose of establishing a slaughter house and dog pound by the Municipal Corporation,

Jalandhar.

Thereafter, a notification under section 6 of the Land Acquisition Act, 1894 was

issued vide Notification No. 14/153/11-4LG1/902 dated the 9th March, 2012 and published in

the Punjab Government Gazette (Extraordinary) on the 12th March, 2012.

And whereas, the possession of the aforesaid land was never taken by the Municipal

Corporation, Jalandhar and remains with the original landowners from the date of the

notification till present nor any amount of compensation has been paid.

And whereas, the final award under section 11 of the Land Acquisition Act, 1894

has not been passed by the Land Acquisition Collector, Jalandhar, within the prescribed

statutory period of two years from the date of declaration, resulting in the lapse of acquisition

proceedings in terms of the provisions of the Land Acquisition Act, 1894.

And whereas, the Land Acquisition Act, 1894 has since been repealed by the Right

to Fair Compensation and Transparency in Land Acquisition, Rehabilitation and Resettlement

Act, 2013 (Central Act No.30 of 2013).

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred under section 48 of the Land

Acquisition Act 1894 and sub-section (1) of section 93 and sub-section (2) of section 114 of

the Right to Fair Compensation and Transparency in Land Acquisition, Rehabilitation and

Resettlement Act, 2013 and section 6 of the General clauses Act, 1897 (Central Act No.10

of 1897) and all other powers enabling him in this behalf, the Governor of Punjab is pleased



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ.(EXTRA), AUGUST 29, 2025

(BHDR 7, 1947 SAKA)

to withdraw from the acquisition proceedings in respect of the land described in the Schedule,

namely:-

SCHEDULE

Name of Had Bast Name of Name of Khasra No. Area

Village No. Tehsil District

Basti Peer 311 Jalandhar-1 Jalandhar Kanal Marlas

Dad

40/21/3 2 1

54/1/1 8 0

10 8 0

11 6 4

12 7 2

55//3/2/1 1 18

4/3 1 0

4/1 3 2

5/1 0 10

5/3 5 7

6 8 0

7/1 7 14

8/1/1 1 9

13/2 0 19

14/3 3 16

Total 65 2

8.15 Acres

Sd/-

TEJVEER SINGH, IAS

Additional Chief Secretary to Government of Punjab,

Department of Local Government.

3489/8-2025/Pb. Govt. Press, S.A.S. Nagar.

1192


